5/2/23, 4:04 PM Mail - ShuLing Teh - Outlook

RE: [External] Re: Request COC for PO#3013381527

Denise Wong <denise.wong@arrowasia.com>
Fri 4/28/2023 4:37 PM

To: Shuling Teh <Shuling_Teh@jabil.com>
Cc: Denise Wong <DENISEWONG@arrow.com>

[I]J 2 attachments (3 MB)

Intel Forums Guidance.pdf; Forum post questions .pptx;

CAUTION: This email was sent from a third party outside of your organization. Please DO NOT click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and
know the content is safe.

If you believe this email is not safe, please DO NOT forward this email. Report this email by right-clicking on the email in your folder view, selecting "Junk", then
"Report Phishing".

Hi Shuling,

Since year 2010, when Jabil need any part information, technical query and quality issue encountered, please file a Service Request to Intel
PSG/Altera in order to get direct and fastest response.
Here is the link to Intel Forums for sign up and submit service request.

https://forums.intel.com/s/.

Please refer to the attached for the details.

*** When you file a service request to Intel Forums, please add the End customer/ CM to the subject line so that Intel able to prioritise it . Examples:
Nokia /Jabil Penang _ subject xxxxxxxxxx ***

Arrow Electronics | arrow.com

From: ShulLing Teh <Shuling_Teh@jabil.com>

Sent: Friday, April 28, 2023 2:59 PM

To: Denise Wong <denise.wong@arrowasia.com>

Cc: Denise Wong <DENISE.WONG@arrow.com>

Subject: Re: [External] Re: Request COC for PO#3013381527

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. This message might not be safe, use caution in opening it. If in doubt, do not open the
attachment nor links in the message.

Hi Denise,
This is due to Jabil's procedure.

If no COC, | cannot cut RT.

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKADVhNDAXZWYyLWFKMjYINDYXNC04YmI1LWZhNGI3YjU2NmMFiYWAQABAXCY 1KtmIPk7NWj4SG8kg...  1/7
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Thank You ©

Best Regards,

ELAINE TEH
Buyer .

l=.Jabil - Made Possible. Made Better.
Jabil Penang, Purchasing

www.jabil.com

TEL: +04-375 4172
Jabil Circuit Sdn. Bhd. 199501007339 (336537-M)

4 B B )
56, Hilir Sungai Keluang 1, lw.Facebook lw.LinkedIn le.Twitter lw.lnstagram

Bayan Lepas Industrial Park,

Phase 4, Bayan Lepas, 11900 Penang

Note:
Please send the INVOICE only to PEN_AP_INV@jabil.com and
Any reminders or payment issue should be address to PEN_AP@jabil.com

COC is mandatory for all incoming, failure to provide this data can result in the inability to receive the parts into our system, pay the invoice, etc.

From: Denise Wong <denise.wong@arrowasia.com>
Sent: Friday, April 28, 2023 2:57 PM
To: Shuling Teh <Shuling_Teh@jabil.com>

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKADVhNDAXZWYyLWFkM]YtNDYXNCO04YmI1LWZhNGI3YjU2NmFiYWAQABAXCY 1KtmIPk7NWj4SG8kg...  2/7
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Cc: Denise Wong <DENISE.WONG@arrow.com>
Subject: RE: [External] Re: Request COC for PO#3013381527

CAUTION: This email was sent from a third party outside of your organization. Please DO NOT click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and
know the content is safe.

If you believe this email is not safe, please DO NOT forward this email. Report this email by right-clicking on the email in your folder view, selecting "Junk", then
"Report Phishing".

Hi Shu Ling,
Please advise why you need the CERTIFICATE OF CONFORMANCE for this shipment ?

Arrow Electronics | arrow.com

From: Shuling Teh <Shuling_Teh@jabil.com>

Sent: Friday, April 28, 2023 2:44 PM

To: Denise Wong <denise.wong@arrowasia.com>

Subject: Re: [External] Re: Request COC for PO#3013381527

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. This message might not be safe, use caution in opening it. If in doubt, do not open the
attachment nor links in the message.

Hi Denise,

COC stands for CERTIFICATE OF CONFORMANCE.
Thank You @

Best Regards,

ELAINE TEH
Buyer .
l#.Jabil - Made Possible. Made Better.

Jabil Penang, Purchasing

www.jabil.com

TEL: +04-375 4172
Jabil Circuit Sdn. Bhd. 199501007339 (336537-M)

56, Hilir Sungai Keluang 1, [#2Facebook [#Linkedin & Twitter Ilfilnstagram

Bayan Lepas Industrial Park,

Phase 4, Bayan Lepas, 11900 Penang

Note:
Please send the INVOICE only to PEN_AP_INV@jabil.com and

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKADVhNDAXZWYyLWFKMjYINDYXNC04YmI1LWZhNGI3YjU2NmMFiYWAQABAXCY 1KtmIPk7NWj4SG8kg...  3/7
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Any reminders or payment issue should be address to PEN_AP@jabil.com

COC is mandatory for all incoming, failure to provide this data can result in the inability to receive the parts into our system, pay the invoice, etc.

From: Denise Wong <denise.wong@arrowasia.com>

Sent: Friday, April 28, 2023 2:35 PM

To: Shuling Teh <Shuling_Teh@jabil.com>

Subject: RE: [External] Re: Request COC for PO#3013381527

CAUTION: This email was sent from a third party outside of your organization. Please DO NOT click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and
know the content is safe.

If you believe this email is not safe, please DO NOT forward this email. Report this email by right-clicking on the email in your folder view, selecting "Junk", then
"Report Phishing".

Hi Shu Ling,
| already provided the COC , country of origin in my last email.

Arrow Electronics | arrow.com

From: Shuling Teh <Shuling_Teh@jabil.com>

Sent: Friday, April 28, 2023 12:50 PM

To: Denise Wong <denise.wong@arrowasia.com>

Subject: Re: [External] Re: Request COC for PO#3013381527

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. This message might not be safe, use caution in opening it. If in doubt, do not open the
attachment nor links in the message.

Hi Denise,

Can u get the COC from Intel due to the document could not found.
Thank You ©

Best Regards,

ELAINE TEH
Buyer .
l#.Jabil - Made Possible. Made Better.

Jabil Penang, Purchasing

www.jabil.com

TEL: +04-375 4172

Jabil Circuit Sdn. Bhd. 199501007339 (336537-M)

56, Hilir Sungai Keluang 1, [#2Facebook wLinkedin lezTwitter e nstagram

Bayan Lepas Industrial Park,

Phase 4, Bayan Lepas, 11900 Penang

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKADVhNDAXZWYyLWFKMjYINDYXNC04YmI1LWZhNGI3YjU2NmMFiYWAQABAXCY 1KtmIPk7NWj4SG8kg...  4/7
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Note:
Please send the INVOICE only to PEN_AP_INV@jabil.com and
Any reminders or payment issue should be address to PEN_AP@jabil.com

COC is mandatory for all incoming, failure to provide this data can result in the inability to receive the parts into our system, pay the invoice, etc.

From: Denise Wong <denise.wong@arrowasia.com>

Sent: Friday, April 28, 2023 12:14 PM

To: Shuling Teh <Shuling_Teh@jabil.com>

Subject: RE: [External] Re: Request COC for PO#3013381527

CAUTION: This email was sent from a third party outside of your organization. Please DO NOT click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and
know the content is safe.

If you believe this email is not safe, please DO NOT forward this email. Report this email by right-clicking on the email in your folder view, selecting "Junk", then
"Report Phishing".

Hi Shu Ling,

This is drop-shipment, It ship from Intel warehouse to Jabil directly and Intel provide full set shipping document to Jabil forwarder when they pick up
at Intel warehouse, Arrow does not involve in this, so we do not have the shipping document. Please check with Jabil forwarder for the shipping
documents.

Arrow Electronics | arrow.com

From: ShulLing Teh <Shuling_Teh@jabil.com>

Sent: Friday, April 28, 2023 9:28 AM

To: Denise Wong <denise.wong@arrowasia.com>
Subject: [External] Re: Request COC for PO#3013381527

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. This message might not be safe, use caution in opening it. If in doubt, do not open the
attachment nor links in the message.

Hi Denise,

Any update on the COC and commercial invoice?
Thank You ©
Best Regards,

ELAINE TEH l+_Jabil - Made Possible. Made Better.

Buyer

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKADVhNDAXZWYyLWFKMjYINDYXNC04YmI1LWZhNGI3YjU2NmMFiYWAQABAXCY 1KtmIPk7NWj4SG8kg...  5/7
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Jabil Penang, Purchasing

www.jabil.com

TEL: +04-375 4172
Jabil Circuit Sdn. Bhd. 199501007339 (336537-M)

56, Hilir Sungai Keluang 1, [#2Facebook l#-Linkedin le-Twitter Lrilnstag@

Bayan Lepas Industrial Park,

Phase 4, Bayan Lepas, 11900 Penang

Note:
Please send the INVOICE only to PEN_AP_INV@jabil.com and
Any reminders or payment issue should be address to PEN_AP@jabil.com

COC is mandatory for all incoming, failure to provide this data can result in the inability to receive the parts into our system, pay the invoice, etc.

From: Shuling Teh <Shuling_Teh@jabil.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 27,2023 1:01 PM

To: EXTERNAL - Denise_Wong Arrowasia <denise.wong@arrowasia.com>
Subject: Request COC for PO#3013381527

Hi Denise,

Kindly help to provide COC and commercial invoice for PO#3013381527.

Thank You ©

Best Regards,

ELAINE TEH
Buyer .

l#.Jabil - Made Possible. Made Better.
Jabil Penang, Purchasing

www.jabil.com

TEL: +04-375 4172

Jabil Circuit Sdn. Bhd. 199501007339 (336537-M)

56, Hilir Sungai Keluang 1, [#2Facebook [#-Linkedin & Twitter I:Zlnﬁgm
Bayan Lepas Industrial Park,

Phase 4, Bayan Lepas, 11900 Penang

Note:

Please send the INVOICE only to PEN_AP_INV@jabil.com and

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKADVhNDAXZWYyLWFKMjYtINDYXNC04YmI1LWZhNGI3YjU2NmMFiYWAQABAXCY 1KtmIPk7NWj4SG8kg...  6/7
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Any reminders or payment issue should be address to PEN_AP@jabil.com

COC is mandatory for all incoming, failure to provide this data can result in the inability to receive the parts into our system, pay the invoice, etc.

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKADVhNDAXZWYyLWFkM]YtNDYXNC04YmI1LWZhNGI3YjU2NmFiYWAQABAXCY 1KtmIPk7NWj4SG8kg...  7/7



